
FOI Request (received 08 January 2019) - Reference: DFI/2019-0013 

Under the Freedom of Information Act I request the following information from your 

Department: 

1) A list of all decisions that have been referred to the Senior Decision Making Forum, 

including: a) the dates of each referral; b) a list of the agreed decisions; c) a list of the 

decisions ; and d) a list of the pending decisions; and  

2) A log of the decisions currently awaiting: a) Senior Decision Making Forum agreement; 

b) Permanent Secretary endorsement; c) Ministerial attention; d) those endorsed by the 

Permanent Secretary and implemented; or e) endorsed by the Permanent Secretary and 

the decision deferred. 

 

 

Response (issued 01 March 2019) 

Thank you for your email dated 08 January 2019 requesting information under the Freedom 

of Information Act 2000.  Please accept my apologies for the delay in replying you with a 

response.  You have specifically requested the above. 

In response to question 1 (a-d), please be advised that the Department does not hold this 

information as it does not have a Senior Decision Making Forum. 

In response to question 2: 

a) A log of decisions that are currently awaiting Senior Decision Making Forum agreement - 

the Department does not hold this information for the reason set out above; 

b) A log of decisions that are currently waiting Permanent Secretary endorsement - The 

Department does not hold this information; 

c) A log of decisions that are currently awaiting Ministerial attention - A list of decisions 

currently awaiting Ministerial attention is attached at Annex A.  Some of this information 

has been withheld under S35 of the FOI Act - formulation of government policy; 

d) A log of decisions that have been endorsed by Permanent Secretary and decisions 

implemented - This information is exempt under Section 21 of the FOI Act 2000.  This is 

an absolute exemption, however, the information is reasonably accessible online at:- 

https://www.executiveoffice-ni.gov.uk/publications/reports-decisions-taken-by-northern-

ireland-departments-2018; and 

https://www.executiveoffice-ni.gov.uk/publications/reports-decisions-taken-by-northern-ireland-departments-2018
https://www.executiveoffice-ni.gov.uk/publications/reports-decisions-taken-by-northern-ireland-departments-2018


e) A log of decisions that have been endorsed by Permanent Secretary and decisions 

deferred - I can confirm that two decisions have been deferred:- 

• Whether an amendment should be made to current planning legislation to remove 

existing permitted development rights for petroleum (oil & gas) exploration; and, 

• The International Road Transport (EU EXIT) Regulations 2018 and Trailer 

Registration (EU Exit) Regulations 2018: Financial Penalty Notices. 

 

 

Copyright notice 

The supply of information under the Freedom of Information Act or the Environmental 

Information Regulations does not give the recipient or organisation that receives it the 

automatic right to reuse it in any way that would infringe copyright.  Information supplied 

continues to be protected by copyright.  You are free to use it for your own purposes, 

including for private study and non-commercial research, and for any other purpose 

authorised by an exception in current copyright law.  Documents (except photographs) can 

also be used in the UK without requiring permission for the purposes of news reporting.  Any 

other re-use, for example commercial publication, would require the permission of the 

copyright holder. 

Most documents provided by a government department or agency will be protected by 

Crown Copyright.  Most Crown Copyright information can be re-used under the Open 

Government Licence.  For information about the OGL and about re-using Crown Copyright 

information, please see The National Archives website. 

Copyright in other documents may rest with a third party.  For information about obtaining 

permission from a third party please see the Intellectual Property Office’s website.  

http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/
http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/doc/open-government-licence/
http://www.nationalarchives.gov.uk/information-management/uk-gov-licensing-framework.htm
http://www.ipo.gov.uk/
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